
Content downloaded/printed from HeinOnline

Wed Jan 29 17:43:30 2020

Citations:

Bluebook 20th ed.
			                                                                
English text of Act A1603 of 4 September 2019 amending Articles 47 and 119 and the
Eighth Schedule to the Constitution of 16 September 1963. 1 (2019)   Constitution
(Amendment) Act 2019                                                                 

ALWD 6th ed.                                                                         

Chicago 7th ed.                                                                      
, "Constitution (Amendment) Act 2019," Constitution (Amendment) Act 2019 (2019): 1-4 

McGill Guide 9th ed.                                                                 
, "Constitution (Amendment) Act 2019" [2019] 1.                                      

MLA 8th ed.                                                                          
"Constitution (Amendment) Act 2019." Constitution (Amendment) Act 2019, , 2019, p.
1-4. HeinOnline.                                                                     

OSCOLA 4th ed.                                                                       
, 'Constitution (Amendment) Act 2019' (2019) 1

Provided by: 
Harvard Law School Library

-- Your use of this HeinOnline PDF indicates your acceptance of HeinOnline's Terms and 
Conditions of the license agreement available at 
https://heinonline.org/HOL/License

-- The search text of this PDF is generated from  uncorrected OCR text.

https://heinonline.org/HOL/Page?handle=hein.cow/zzmy0009&collection=cow&id=1&startid=1&endid=3
https://heinonline.org/HOL/License
marziehtofighidarian
Pencil



LAWS OF MALAYSIA

Act A1603

CONSTITUTION (AMENDMENT) ACT 2019



Date of Royal Assent

Date of publication in the
Gazette

...... 4 September 2019

... ... ... 10 September 2019

Publisher's Copyright Q
PERCETAKAN NASIONAL MALAYSIA BERHAD
All rights reserved. No part of this publication may be reproduced, stored in a retrieval system or transmitted in any form or by any means
electronic, mechanical, photocopying, recording and or otherwise without the prior permission of Percetakan Nasional Malaysia Berhad
(Appointed Printer to the Government of Malaysia).



LAWS OF MALAYSIA

Act A1603

CONSTITUTION (AMENDMENT) ACT 2019

An Act to amend the Federal Constitution.

I

ENACTED by the Parliament of Malaysia as follows:

Short title and commencement

1. (1) This Act may be cited as
Act 2019.

the Constitution (Amendment)

(2) Section 3 of this Act comes into operation on a date to be
appointed by the Yang di-Pertuan Agong by notification in the
Gazette.

Amendment of Article 47

2. The Federal Constitution is amended in Article 47, in paragraph (b),
by substituting for the words "twenty-one years" the words
"eighteen years".



4 Laws of Malaysia ACT A1603

Amendment of Article 119

3. Article 119 of the Federal Constitution is amended-

(a) in Clause (1), in paragraph (a), by substituting for the
words "twenty-one years" the words "eighteen years";
and

(b) in Clause (4), in paragraph (b), by substituting for the
words "applies for registration" the words "is registered".

Amendment of Eighth Schedule

4. The Eighth Schedule to the Federal Constitution is amended
in section 5 by substituting for the words "twenty-one years" the
words "eighteen years".


